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Pharmacognosy Journal <editor phcogi@gmail coms Nov30,2021,319PM ¢ € H
tome, bernaelya ¥

Dear Dr. nimi prastiws,

Thank you very much for your submission to the Pharmacognosy Journal. We have received vour article entitled "The Effect of
Antioxidant activity, Total Phenols and Total Flavonoids on Arginase Inhibitory Activity on Plants of Genus Sterculia ”. The article is
now under our PRELIMINARY EVALUATION and we will keep you updated on the article status accordingly.

As we are an open-access non-profit organization, we require publication charges to recover our editorial and production expenses.
They cover the range of publishing services we provide which includes the provision of online tools for editors and authors, article
production and hosting, liaison with abstracting and indexing services, and customer services. The publication charges are 750 USD
(discount provided) for the accepted article. You are required to process publication charges upon acceptance of your article (after peer-
review). Kindly confirm your response to proceed with the review process.

We thank you for submitting your valuable work to the Pharmacognosy Journal.

Kindly get back to us for further queries.

pharmacognosy journal X 3 @ @ i
B © @ = e B D

Rini Prastiwi <khanzapras@gmail.com= Dec1.2021.1211PM €
to Pharmacognosy »

Dear Emily Flora
Thank you for the information. Emily, for the publication charges 750 USD), its too expensive for me. May I ask for a discount, if my article

accepted? I often sent my research in this journal, may be you can consider this. Thank you for your help.

Best regards

Rimi Prastion

Pharmacognosy Journal Dec1,207, 159PM ¥
Dear Dr. rini prastiwi, Thanks for your email. We would like to inform you that our actual charges are 1199 USD. as you are our esteemed author we have already
Rini Prastiwi Dec1,2021, 233PM 3

Please, Give me some time for few days. to think about it. thank You Emily Best regards
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Pharmacognosy Journal Dec1,2021.235PM Yy ~

We will be waiting for your reply. Regards, Emily Flara

Pharmacognosy Journal Dec10,2021, :11PM ¥
Dear Dr. rini prastiwi, Could you please let me know the update on the publication charges. Awaiting your reply. Regards, Emily Flora

Pharmacognosy Journal Dec13,2021,204PM ¥
On Fri, Dec 10, 2021 at 11:41 AM Ph: 108y Journal <editor. ph il.com= wrote: Dear Dr. rini prastiwi, Could you please let me know the update on t...

Rini Prastiwi Dec16.2021.1025AM  tY
Dear Emily Flora, | am sorry | can't continue to publish my article in your journal. May be another time, when its suitable moment. Thank you Best regards

Pharmacognosy Journal Dec16,2021,232PM Yy
Dear Rini, Thanks for your email_ f publication charges are the main issue, we are happy to provide you with a more discount on charges. Finally, you will be r

Pharmacognosy Journal Dec18.2021.124PM Ty
On Thu, Dec 16, 2021 at 1:02 PM Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com= wrote: Dear Rini, Thanks for your email. If publication charges are the mai...

B 0 @ B 0 @ B

Rini Prastiwi Dec1.2021.233PM ¥y
Please, Give me some time for few days, to think about it. thank You Emily Best regards

Pharmacognosy Journal Dec1.2021.235PM v
We will be waiting for your reply. Regards, Emily Flora

Pharmacognosy Journal Dec 10,2021, T1IPM ¥y
Dear Dr. rini prastiwi, Could you please let me know the update on the publication charges. Awaiting your reply. Regards, Emily Flora

Pharmacognosy Journal Dec13.2021, 204PM ¥
On Fri, Dec 10, 2021 at 11:41 AM Pharmacognosy Journal <editor phcogi@gmail com: wrote” Dear Dr_rini prastiwi, Could you please lat me know the update ont

Rini Prastiwi Dec16,2021.1025AM ¢
Dear Emily Flora, | am sorry | can't continue to publish my article in your journal. May be another time, when its suitable moment. Thank you Best regards

Pharmacognosy Journal Dec1s,2021,232PM ¥y
Dear Rini, Thanks for your email. If publication charges are the main issue, we are happy to provide you with a more discount on charges. Finally, you will be r
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Pharmacognosy Journal Dec 18,2021, 124PM ¥
On Thu, Dec 16, 2021 at 1:02 PM Phar Journal <editor. com> wrote: Dear Rini, Thanks for your email_ If publication charges are the mai...

Rini Prastiwi Dec20,2021.229PM vy
Dear Emily Flora Thank you for the discount that has been given. But 'm sorry, the price is still higher than our budget for publication. Maybe next time we wi

Pharmacognosy Journal Dec20.2021.Z45PM ¥
Dear Dr. Rini, Thanks for your reply. Finally, you will be requested to pay 620 USD upon the article acceptance. Kindly let me know your final decision. Regards

Pharmacognosy Journal Dec 21,2021, 4:08PM ¢
On Mon, Dec 20, 2021 at 1:15 PM Pharmacognosy Joumal <aditor phcogi@gmail com> wrote: Dear Dr. Rini, Thanks for your reply. Finally, you will be requested t

Pharmacognosy Journal Dec 27,2021, 405PM ¥
On Tue, Dec 21, 2021 at 2:38 PM Phar Journal <editor. com> wrote: On Mon, Dec 20, 2021 at 1:15 PM Pharmacognosy Journal <editor..__

Pharmacognosy Journal Dec29.2021.347PM ¥y
On Mon, Dec 27. 2021 at 2:35 PM Pharmacoanosy Journal <editor. phcogi@amail.com wrote: On Tue, Dec 21. 2021 at 2:38 PM Pharmacognosy Journal <editor... V¥
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Pharmacognosy Journal Jan 10, 2022, 5:02 PM
Dear Rini, Yes. its fine. Kindly confirm to initiate review process. Regards, Emily Flora

Rini Prastiwi Jan 10,2022, 503 PM
Ok.let me inform to my team

Rini Prastiwi Jan 10, 2022, 6:47 PM

Dear Emily. My team is OK, please proceed the manuscript. Thanks & Regards

Pharmacognosy Journal Jan 11, 2022, 15 PM
Dear Dr. Rini, Thank you for your kind response and confirming the charges. Soon, we will get back to you with the review comments. Regards, Emily Flora

Rini Prastiwi Jan 11,2022, 6:36 PM
Noted with thanks

Rini Prastiwi Jan 28,2022, 12:52 PM
Dear Emily Flora Is there any comection/ progress for my manuscript?. And when it can be published? Thank you




